4. AWARD OF CONTRACT
It 1s the intent of the District to award a contract(s) for each item in the Rate Schedule
Section either “per category,” “individually”, “in any combination”, or “as a whole,” to
any of the three lowest responsive and responsible bidder(s), pursuant to the authority
granted under California Public Contract Code Sections 20111 and 20118.1, to a single or
to multiple vendors, whichever is in the best interest of the District. Award is contingent
upon timely compliance with all bid conditions and specifications which must be satisfied
prior to award of contract.
Arey Jones has reviewed this information presented and confirms it's understanding.

5. BASIS OF AWARD
The award(s) shall be made to the responsive and responsible bidder(s) who submits the
Lowest Total Combined costs, either “individually”, “per category”, “as a whole” or “in
any combination”, whichever may be in the best interest of the District. All “rate of
discount offered” in the bid must be as District requested (i.e. case, each, package, etc.).
After contract award and for items under “rate of Discount”, the Contractor shall be held
to the “Percentage Rate of Discount” submitted from published price list for each specified
manufacturer.

The “percentage rate of discount offered” bid in the Rate Schedule Section (Section iii)
shall include any delivery charge to allow for delivery on an FOB Destination basis. The
District will verify all conversion and computations, if necessary.

The cash/trade discount shall be included in the determination of Iow bid. A cash discount
for a time period of less than 30 days may be considered. The cash discount offered in
excess of 10% will be considered a “trade discount”. A trade discount offered will be
deducted from the unit price(s) bid, thus establishing the items normal/actual contract cost
with zero percent cash discount for early payment.

A Cash Discount of 0 % 45 Days is being offered.

Payment is contingent upon acceptance of the work and approval of invoice(s) by the
District Authorized Representative or designee.

The District, in an effort to become the Public agency of choice, has expanded upon its
ongoing Small Business Enterprise (SBE) program to further encourage and promote SBE
participation in District business opportunities.

In furtherance of the SBE community and program, efforts resulting in contract award(s)
stemming from this solicitation, any contract awardee(s) from this solicitation who are
certified Small Business Enterprises, will be entitled to a faster payment process. Contract
awardee(s) who have been certified by agencies such as the State of California’s
Department of General Services, the City of Los Angeles, Metropolitan Water District, or
by the Los Angeles Unitied School District (must attach proof of certification at the time
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Section HI
Rate Schedule Section

Bidder Name: Arey Jones Educational Solutions

| Estimated Annual
LT Quantity Item Breseription ==- Percentage Discount Discounted Price | Brand Product No. | Extended Caost
- - T 1
1 99 i’ e | BLOLIECH ILAUSD -1 $ 295.00 | 139002, [ 25743 Logitech 960-601667 $ 2548557
ontent camers base |
. - - — — ! - —
2 300 Bocumen: Camera #2. LOGITECH : LAUSD - Logitech | ¢ 269,00 1350 % |§ 25743 [ ogitech 960-601 668 $ 7m0
_ Content camer - clamp — N A 4 1 o
|
Node 1: Bidder to indicate percentage (o) ofT catalog, for other _3%c{Perceniape discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. Uhis will not be mchided m the Basis of Award
**Discounted uniz cost sheuld nelude Section 11024 Required Services

CATEGORY 2: COLLABORATION DEVICE

Estimated Annual
Ttem No. _|Quantity List Price Percentage Discount | Discounfed Price  |Brand Product No. Extended Cost
e [ - VETSIO | o A |

lae o9 ) $ 999.00 13840, | 86072 Logiech | 939001950 s 1128
2] £ S — 1 .

b ” 3-vear warranty wfth an-site repaw replacement $ 239.00 3031%.;, |s 696.16 Logitech | SOE000 145! s 68,919.84

Badder te indicate percentage ("o) off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software not ksted above* 5%% (Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog, with vour bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Aweard

** Discounted unit cost should include Section 11.C_ 24 Required Senvices

CATEGORY 3: COLLABORATION CAMERA BAR

Estimated Annual
Item No. Ouantity Item Description = List Price_
| Collaboration Camera Bar: LOGITECH - 1 h Rally Bar 3 3.999.00 1.445.48 Logitech 960-001308 § 341.102.52
Ha R . [y - 1 | 13 S e e ‘ -
lab. 99 _|opisonal 3:year service plan ) 3 99990 | 3031% 0w s 69616 Logutech | 994;-00!}14? % 68,919.84
Bidder to indicale percentage (*4) off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above® 594 { Percentage discount)

with vour bid This will ot be mcludeld i the Basis of Awanl
section 1L 24 Heguired Services

*Please inelude a copy of the catale
** Lhscounted wnif cost should miciu

Estimated Annual

Ttem wu. Cuantity |I|nn Description List Price |Perventage Discount Discounted Price  Brand Product No. Extended Cost
I5a 1000 Plugable Dual Monitor Docking Station Hub b 13999 4838, g 154 Plgsble | UD-3300H §  TATe000
__L1dul . .
s 1000 |oprional 2nd year manufacturer warmniy | tcluded with Dock | Included with Dock %0 % i Included with Dock Plugable | ]nclude.d.with Dock | Included with Dock
Bidder 10 indicate percentage (3o} off catalog for other
Note Iz hardware and sofiware not listed above® 5% {Percentage discount)

*Please nclude a copy of the catalog wi
howld hu 3

wr bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
1L 24, Kequired Senices

chide

** Dscounted unil ¢

CATEGORY 5: STUDENT HEADSETS

Estimated Annual

ltem No. Quantity Percentage Discount Extended Cost

!» 100,000 - 3 Smm Stereo Headsets with Boom Mic) 2053 s, 942 ThinkWriee $ 01200000 |
Bidder to indicate percentage (%) off catalog for other

Note 1: hardware and software not listed above® 5% {Percentage discouns)
|

*Please mclude a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award |
**Discounted unit cost should nclude Section 11LC. 24 Required Services -

Estimated Annmal [
Item No. Quantity List Price |Percentage Discount Discounted Price Extended Cost
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid
[ I |, . U |Projector 1 - 1 - | b
Optional Peedless ceiling mount suspension plaie and I Ne Bid Ne Bid Mo Hid Nu Bid | No Bid | No Bid
ITb kL] (extension column and or other District-approved |||1|ml:n.lur_u;[+ ;o | |
& oo |projectors: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ‘ No Bid NoBid
I |30 aject =N { — { —— |
i,i 500 {Projector #3 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid | . No Bid |
10 109 Projector #4 | No Bid No Bid . No Bid No Bid [ No Bid | No Bid
T 1
lu i - |Peojector s No Bid | No Bid | No Bid NoBd | N [ | NoBid |
Scoten 111 &
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Section 11
Rate Schedule Section

10

No Bid Mo Bid

Projector #6 1

‘ | Nao Bid

No Bid Ne Rid ’

Note 1z

CATEGORY T:

Bidder to indicate pereentage (7o) off catalog for other
hardware and softw are niol hsted above®
TPlease melude & copy of the catalog with your bid 1 s wll not be ncluded i the Basis ot Award

**Discoupied unit cost should include Section 1L C.24. Required Services

NTERACTIVE COMPATIBLE DRY ERASER BOARDS AND PROJECTION SCREENS

®o (Percentage disconnt)

Estimated Annual '
Ttem No. antity ] |List_Price Percentage Discount Driscounted Price | Brand Product No. Extended Cost
| INTERACTIVE COMPATIBLE DRY ERASER HOARD No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid o Bid | No Bid
13 1000 £l | ) 5 |
|14 S00 |PROIECTION SCREEN #1 No Bid 1} No Bid % s | No Bid No Bid | o Bid | No Bid
f | [ |
No Bid No Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid Ne Bid
15 . PROJECTION SCREEN 52 1 | 1 |
e No Bid No Bul ™o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
|16 [PROJECTION SCREEN #3 | s | _ 1 ] |

Bidder to ndicate percentage (°a) off canalog: for vther
are and soﬁg.arc not listed above™

hardw
TEIEAsE HICINAC 4 COPY OF e CAIRIOE W IR YOUr DI, 1 BIS U1 0T D #)1CIM0ed 1 Uie Basis 01 Awanm

** Discounted unit cost should mclude Section ILC. 24. Reguired Ser ices

%o (Percentage discount)

CATEGORY 8: INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL TOUCH DISPLAY BOARDS

Estimated Annwal ,l Product No. Exiended Cost
Item No, Quantity rIlrm Description ‘Perl‘t‘_p’ln_g_\ ¢ Discount Discounted Price |Brand
:INTERACT]VE FLAT PANEL DISPLAY -
17 [INTERACTIVE TOLICH BOARD #1 s w5 | B o}
T APLX-65-NAT |
657 Promethean ActivPanel LX 65" with OPS-Android| § 251349 4857 129280 Promethean | \56€ Quote for Pan $ 77568000
Number/List
a 600 | - % (8 Breakdown) !
b silo =erl No Bid NoBidy, ¢ | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid|
[ I I APLXTENAT
| 75" Promethean ActivPanel LX 75" with OPS-Android| § 3.983.49 56,040, 1,59580  Promethean (“;‘;:‘;szi:"" $ 95748000
|G b} | i a |$ Breakdowni I
d 600 w0 No Bidi NoBid. |¢ No Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid N Hid
[ | APLX-86-NA-1
85" Promethean ActivPanel LX B6" with OPS-Android| $ 5,893.49 58.36% 245430 Promothean | (5% Quot for Pan § 147258000
Number/List
e [G1] 113 Breakdown)
. lca wall oung 1elded with bousd |inciuded with poord || Incloed withboard  Promethean | Tnudked with b v
A 1000 | cartstand| § 419,00 15630, | 35350 Promethean AP-FSM-TR $ 35390000
Bidder w indicate percentage (%) ofT catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above* 10 % (Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid, This will not be included in the Basis of Award

**Discounted unit cost should melude Secton 11C. 24. Reguired Services

Estimated Annual

Ttem No. uanfity Item Description List Price |Percentage Discount Discounted Price  |Brand _Product No.

js 2000 ATSC TV Converter Switch MNoBid No Bid % |s No Bid o Bid

19 2000 442 HOMI Matrix Switch No Bid No Hid % |5 o Bid No Bid

";_ 1500 Portable Mubile PA System ] No Bid No Bid N No Bid | Nebi |

|21 1500 | UHF Candioid Dynamic Wireless Micophone System | "0 Bid o Bid % s oL MoBil

IZZ 1M FM Plus-L arge-area Dual FM and Wi-Fi base transmitier I No Bid ™o Bid . ] No Bid | No Bid No B
23 00 EM Receiver with seck-bution channel selection No Bid No Bid % |S NoBid | Ne Bid NoBid
l24 oo r - Folding Headphones L No Rid % It No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
l2s 100  Larpe wer-resismn: Camy Case NoBid No Bid “ s No Bid No Bid No Hid
= - | Neckloop No Bid No Bid o s No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 1500 | - Mobile Storage Cart No Bid No Bid % |s No Bid No Bid NoBd |

Bidder to indicate percentage (%o) off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware ard software not listed above* *a (Percentage discount)

*Please mclude a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

++Di

unit cost should include Section [1.C. 24. Required Services

Secwon i
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Section [N
Rate Schedule Section

CATEGORY 10A: INTEGRAT

CATEGORY 10B: INTEGRATION SERVICES FOR NON-HYBRID COMPONENTS (INCLUDING PROJECTORS, DOCUMENT CAMERAS, INTERACTIVE TOVUCH FLAT P

HIDDER MUST PROVIDE PRICING ON A MINIMUM OF ONE INTEGRATION SERVICES CATEGORY (10A OR 10B) AND MAY PROVIDE PRICING ON BOTH

Estimated Annual
OQuantity
0

_Item Deseription 3
W - INTEGRATION SERVICES

Cost Per Unit

TON SERVICES WITH WAREHOUSING AND DELIVERY FOR HY BRID COMPONENTS (HUB, CAMERA BAR, EARSPEAKERS, ETC.)

Estimated Annual
Quantity

ltem Description_

" *Pleasc include & copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

ANEL DISPLAYS, ETC.)

294 1000 SECTION 1- INTEGRATION SERVICES (per unit charge) | $59 50
298 200M) SECTION [- INTEGRATION SERVICES (per hour charge)| 4750
jeils 15060 TRAINING SERVICES (per hour) Inchuded
[; *Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included i the Basis of Award
\
Seamon 111 o
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Section 11
Rate Schedule Section

Bidder Name: Arey Junes Educutional Solutions

CATEGORY I: DOCUMENT CAMERA

| Estimated Annuat | | |
Tten. Cruantity {ltem Description List_Price Percentage Discount l Discounted Price | Brand Product No. Extended Cost
1 l'n ) G FLOGITECH : LAUSD -Logdech | ¢ 296 000 13900 %0 |$ 257.43 Logitech 960-001667 $ 2548557
= — — — 1 H— 1 IS N —
] et Camer #2 i 1SD - Logi
2 300 I e B OGITTCHILALSD - Logiiech 209,00 1390% % |§ 257.43 Logitech 960-001 668 $ 7722900
— e T e I S— - | N — — . 1
| Note 1! Bidder te indicate percentage (%o} off catalog for other 5" (Percentage discount)
[ *Please mciude a copy of the catalog with vour bed 1his wilk not be meluded n the Basis of Avward
L — **Discounted unit cost should mclude Section 11.C. 24 Required Senvices _ 1
Estimsted Annyal
uam |lrm 1] tion List Price Percentage Discount Discounted Price  |Brand Product No. Extended Cost
TIOPRVINT T ORECTT Ty C OnIoT Sereen-v "HT"'n'J_ = " . = 4 =
i ™ _ Sl Carse Ki o900 | 13800, g 860.72 Logiech | 939001950 | § 8521128 |
3b 29 Opticnal 3-vear warranty wh on- replacement $ P99.0 3031%.q, 5 696.16 Logitech | 994-0001 48 $ 68.919.81

Bidder 10 indicate percentag ¢ for other
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above® 5% {Percentage discount) |

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Awerd
**Di d unit ¢osi should mclude Section I1.C. 24, Required Services

CATEGORY 3: COLLABORATION CAMERA BAR

Estimated Annual
Ttem No. Craantity mﬁnn D Discounted Price Product No, Extended Cost
e Bl i :

" - don Camers Bar. LOGITECH - Logiiech Rally Har - 2.999.00 e, || 3,445,438 Logitzch 966001308 § 3410252
—_ e RN 4 — — 4 ————— - = — S— ———
“ ow |[ yisnad 3k i i 3 999,00 . 0315, | 69616 Logitech 994000148 § 68,919.84

Bidder to indicate percentage {%5) off catalog for other

Note 1: hardware ind software noi lisied above* 5% (Percentage discount)
*Please include a copy of the catalog with vour bid. Thls will nat be |ndudcd in the Basis of Award
= *ihscounted unit cost shoukd mchide Section ILC 24 Hegquired &

Estimated Aanual |
Quanitity liem Description |List_Price |Percentage Discount Discounted Price  Brand Praduci No, Extended Cost
1000 Plugable Dual Monitor Docking Station Hub | ¥ 139.99 | 48.38% o g | 72.76 Plugable UD-3900H $ 72.760.00
sh L1000 Chntional Ind year ma warranty | Included with Bock | Included with Dock %o |3 | Included with Dock Plugable Included with Dock Inciuded with Dock:
& I— L L. | =
Bidder 1o ndicate perces s (%o} off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software not llsled above* 5% {Percentage discount)

*Picase include 2 copy of the catalog with vour bid. Thies will not be ineluded in the Basis of Award
**Discounted unit cost should melude Seciion 1L 24 Hequired Services

CATEGORY 5: STUDENT HEADSETS
Estimated Annuszl |
Quanti _Item Description ane |List Price \Percentage Disconnt | __Di |Brand Product No.
| ) o, 3 ir -

ls [100.000 3.5 Stereo Headiséts wid Bioom M) © 2099 55.00%, | I 942 Think Writz TW-100 $ 542,000 00 |

Bidder to indicate percentage (*:) off caalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software not listed ahove* 5% {Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with y our bid. Fhis will not be included in the Basis of Awerd
**Discounted unit cost should include Secton [1C. 24 Reguired Services

|
ltem Deseription Percentage Discount | Discounted Price  |Brand Product No. Extended Cost
I 1 P T e — = —
. | No Bid _ Ko Bid | womd No Bid No Bid | NoBa
\Ta i 'rapecton #1 | I | ]
|Optioral Peerbess ceiling mount suspension plaie ard No Bid o Bid Ne Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid
b 90 ~ _extension column and or other District-approved manufactirer |
Projectar #2 J No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid | No Bid No Bid
ojector 8.0
e o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [
| Projector #3 1 — 1] - |
1
¥ ar #4 No Bid No Bid No Bid N Bid ’ No Bid No Bid |
1 ] ll“ Biciciins ] . No Bid . | Ne Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
oo 111 &

Rae Schedule LMD Z00000236%




Section HI
Rate Schedule Section

| | T [ ]
No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid ~o Bid [ No Did
12 11} |Projector #o 1L
Bidder to mdicate perce

are
1 Copy

age (% o) off catalop for other

rsted] abaye® %5 {Percentage discount)
e catalog wth vour bid. Lhis will not be included in the Basis ot Award
ould inclede Section 11.C. 24, Keguired Senvices

Note 1:

Vil co

Estimated Annual |
|
(Quantity Iem Description List Price Percentage Disconnt Discounted Price  |Brand Product No. Extended Cost
INTERACTIVE COMPATIBLE DRY ERASER BOARD No Bid No Bid | | No Bid No Bid No Bid WoBid
i3 o 1 B o " s P 1 i
| . . . i
s |s0o J.f."?l”l"\ FION SCREEN#1 No Bid No Bid . ‘P No Bid | No Bid | o Rud | No Bid
- 4
[' No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
s B0 |PROJECTION SCREEN #2 . | " s | o
| | 1
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bud
Ll PROJECTION SCREEN #3 } %% l$ ]

Bidder to ndicate percentage (%) off cataloy for other

Note 1: b 5 are n ed abone® s {Pesentage discount)
M ¢ CALII WY O B LIS W08 D N INaen nIne 1$asis of Awara

CATEGORY 8: INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL TOUCH DISPLAY BOARDS

) Katimuted Anmwal | Product No. Exteader Cost
Ttem No. Quantity |List_Price Percentage Discount
INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL DISPLAY -
17 INTERACTIVE TOUCI BOARD #1 ) s % s o)
| APLX-65-NA-1
65" Promethean ActivPanel LX 65" with OPS-Chromebos| § 153549 44.08% ' 142915 Prometesn | (50 Quote for Pat § R3749000
| Number/List
a - 600 | | % |5 | Breakdiowi
" i [ S No Bid No Bid o | ~e Bid No Bid No Bid No Hid
T APTX-T5-NAT
| 757 Promethean ActivPanel 1.X 75" with OPS-Chromebox| § 402549 | 56.97% 1,73215  Promethean [WN(;:‘;L‘;,"‘_’L:’“" $  1,039,200.00
e |;°.'"F' —I'— . —— = = L - |  Breahdowny [
la 500 80" No Hid| NoBids, g No Bid No Bid No Bid No Iad
| I | i APLX-86-NA-1
85": Promethean ActwPanel LX 86" with OPS-Chromebos| $ 5.935.49 56.35% 250065 Prometheon | Sec Quote for Pan $ 155430000
Number/List
v G _ % % _ Breskdown)
t 1000 wall mount 1Meluded with baard |Included with board o Is Included with board Prometheen Inchuded with board '”"i:';li“"h_
g 1000 carvsiand| 419.00 1563%., s 353 50 Promethzan | AP-FSM-TR $ 35330000
Bidder 1o indicate percentage (%) off catalog for ofher |
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above* 10 % (Percentage discoln(}
*Please include z copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
| **iscounied unit cost should include Section ILC_ 24. Required Services

CATEGORY %: ALUDIO VIDEO MEDIA ACCESSORIES

Estimated Annual | |
Quantity |Htem Description __|List_Price Percentage Discount Discounted Price Product No.
s 2000 ATSC TV Converer Switch NoiBid No Bid % s oDl No Bid
h — — ] -
19 2000 432 HDMI Matrix Switch No Hid [ No Bid % S No Bid | No Bid
—e - T 5 P | .

20 11500 Portable Mobile PA System | No Bid o Bid s 8 No Bid Ne Bid

| No Bid No Bid No B No Bid

SH1 TFIF Cardioid [ nanis: eless Microph Sy ste % |8
2 pisw _ | UFLF Cardioid Dynanic Wircless Microphone System | — - i =
122 100 |FM Plus-Langze-area Dual FM and Wi-Fi hase transmitter No Bid No Bid l\ln Bid No Hid No Bid
|23 SIN) FM Receiver with seek-hutton channel selection | No Bid No B Mo Bid No Bid | No Bid
PR |suo [ Folding Heariphonss | No Bid i No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 100 _l_ Large water-resistant Camy Case I Ne Bid No Bid Ne Bid | No Hid No Bid
26 200 Neckloop No Bud No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid
2 . : |
i 1500 Mohile Storge Can No Bid | Ne Bid [s No Bid ] No Bid | [ No Bid
| Bidder to indicate percentage (%) off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software niot listed above® % (Percentage discount)
*Please inclade a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will nof be mcluded n the Basis of Award
**Discounted unit cost should inciude Section [1.C, 24, Required Services J

Seetion 111 o
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Section HI
Rate Schedule Scction

BIDDER MUST PROVIDE PRICING ON A MINIMUM OF ONE INTEGRATION SERVICES CATEGORY (10A OR 10B) AND MAY PROVIDE PRICING ON BOTH

CATEGORY 10A: INTEGRATION SERVICES WITH WAREHOUSING AND DELIVERY FOR HY BRID COMPONENTS (HUB, CAMERA BAR, EARSPEAKERS. ETC.)

[tem No.
~

|Cost Per Unit
[SECTION |- INTEGRATION SERVICES 78

*Please mclude a copy of the catalog with your tid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

CATEGORY 108: INTEGRATION SERVICES FOR NON-HYBRID COMPONENTS (INCLUDING PROJECTORS, DOCUMENT CAMERAS, INTERACTIVE TOUCH FLAT P

ANEL DISPLAYS. ETC.)

Estimated Annual |

Item No. Quantity __|em Deseription |Cost

1_11 9A_ 1000 [SECTION 1- INTEGRATION SERVICES {per unil charge)

29B 2000 ISECTION 1- INTEGRATION SERVICES (per hour charge):

29 [1500 [TRAINING SERVICES (per hour) Included

E- *Please inciude & copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

|

Secton U] &
Rakc Schedule

1R 2700002768




CATEGORY I: DOCUMENT CAMERA

Section I
Rate Schedule Section

Bidder Name: Arev Jones Fducational Solutions

Estimated Annual
Tten Cuantity Item Description List Price Percentage Discount nid_ Product No. Extended Cost |
1 90 Dooument Camem. #1: L OGITECH -1 ALSD - Logiech [ 299.00 1350% %, |$ | 25743 l_ogn.euh 960.001667 $ 2548557
|Content camers baswe | | — —
| | 2: 15D - o .
2 300 | Document Camera #2: LUGITECH LAUSD - Logiich $ 296.00 1390% %0 |$ 25743 Logiteeh 960-001668 5 77,229.00
_Content camersa - clamp - | | | =— - 5 4
Note 1: Bidder to indicaic pereentage (° o) off catalog for other 5%, Percentage discount)
TPlgase include a copy of the catalog with yeur bid. |l will not be mckaded i the Basis of Awand

CATEGORY

**Discounted umit cost should include Section 11.C. 24 Required Services

I: COLLABORATION DEVICE

Estimated Annual |
Quantity _|ltem Description = List_Price _|{Percentage Disconnt | I_l]'nmnnkd Price  |Rrand Product No.
—‘l—‘mﬁrnﬂ'lm"rn. 7 T - — =

[Jtem No. — melfd Cast
ST T C I SCTCCT- VETs i ; 3 =

o 99 12 with Carse Kit |8 w000 | B g | 360,72 Logitech 939-001950 85.211.28

Ab @9 Optional 3-vear warranty with on-site repair replacemen 5 995.00 3031% ., 696.16 Logitech F94-D0014 5 68.919.8

| Bidder to indicate percentage (%o) off catalog for other

| Note 1: hardware and software not listed above* 5%a (Percentage discotnt)

CATEGORY

3

*Please include a copy of the catalop with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

**Discounted unit cost should melude Section 1L, 24 Required Services

TOLLABORATION CAMERA HAR

-

Extended Cost

3 341.102.52

5 68,919.84

Estimated Anaual
1fem No. Quantity (ltem Description = List Price Percentage Disconnt Discounted Price  |Brand Product No.
1
Collsboration Camera Bar: LOGITECH © Logitech Rally Bar 4 5 199,00 13845 1.445.48 Logitech 960-001308
4a 9% +huplnl. il — Ya IS +
| s l y i | -
4h Ll \Optional 3-vear service plan ¥ el 303%, o | MRS L.ogitech | 000138
Bidder to indicate pereeniage (26) off catalog for other
Note I hardware and software not listed above® 5%q (Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy af he catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
#¥ I scounted Uil cost should mc:lu%e dechon JLL . 24, Hequired bervices

Estimated Annual

ltem ivu Quantity Il'rmnuge Discount Discounted Price  Bramil FProduct No. Extended Cost

|5a 1000 |Plugable Dual Monitor Docking Statien Hub ¥ 13999} 838, I il Plugable oA & =iens
T = |

lgh 1000 Ciptional 2nd year manufecturer warrnty | Included with Dock | Incleded with Dock % |§ | Included with Dock Plugable Included with Dock .Il'ncludcd with Dock

— 4 L LU L 2 a B Lt SR S T ——
Bidder to indicate percentage (%) off catalog for other

Note 1: hardware and software not listed above® 5% {Percentzge discount)

*Please include o copy of the catalog with vous bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
= * iscounted umt cost should mchude Section 1L 74 Required Services

CATEGORY

Tiem No.

—_

5:STUDENT HEADSETS

Estimated Annual
Quantity ripti List Price

e

ity = ist_Pric Percentage Discount Discounted Price  |Brand Product No.
6 100,000 3 Smun Stere Headsets with Boom Mic| ) — ‘ 220G . T Talon

__Extended Cost

¥ G42,000.06) |

Bidder eo indicats percentage (%o) off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above* 524 (Percentage discouni)

*Please inclnde a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
**Discounted unit cost sha Section 11C. 24 Required Services

| Estimated Annnal
Ttem No. | Quantity Tiem Description rI.i4a| Price |Percentage Discount Discounted Price  |Brand _Extended Cost
| s No Bid l No Bid No Bid | Ne Bid No Bid
0 ;] ector | !

|Optional Peerless ceiling mount suspension plate ad No Bid [ Na Bid Na Bid | No Bid Ne Bid | Nopid
Th 00 extension column and o other District-approved manufacturer
ls 500 [Projector #2 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid | Wo Bid No Bid |

) ) . - I . - T . . |

iﬂ..’ lsoo Projector #3 No Bid No I-lld No Bid No Bud ! No Bid No Bid |
|10 199 Projector 44 | Nomd | No Bid NeBil | Nemid | NoBid | Nomu
i i [ | No Bid | No Bid No Bid | Nn Bid [ No B No Bid
Secton 11) 6
Rase Schedule [FR 2000002168




Sextion HI

Rate Schedule Section
T 1 T - — .
Mo Bid [ No Bid | No Bid No Rid NoDid No Bid
12 10 Projclor iy ] 1 | | |
Bidder 1o indicate percentage (o) ofl catalog for other
Note 1z hardware and software not Tisted above® ®a{Percentage discount)

[ *Please mnchude 2 mp; ot the catalog with vour bid. 1 As will not be mcleded in the Basis of Award
**Discounted unn cost skould mclude Seetion 110 24 Reguired Services

Estimated Annual
Ttem No. Cruantity Item Description 135t Price Percentage Discount Discounted Price | Brand Product No. Extended Cost
OYTIE 3 T 1 T
INTERACTIVE COMPATIBLE DRY FRASER BOARD o Bid No Bid ) No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid
13 | 1000 L1 ! |8 | o
" 500 PROJECTION SCREEN 71 ™o Bid L No Bid o i?' No Bid | No Bud No Bad No Bid
t S
No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid NoBid No Bid
PROJECTION SCREEN #2 4- w s |
| 1 1
e Bid | Mo Bid o g No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
i & —— e i
o mdicate percentage (%) ofl catalog for other
Note 1: and software noet listed above® "o (Percentage discount)
CIUGE 3 COPY OF INE CALIOE WIlh Y Our DI I NS W L1} Il'll De nCiuded In |\Ee Basis of Avard
: **Discounted unit cost should iclude Section 11.C. 24. Reguired Senvices = -

CATEGORY 8: INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL TOUCH DISPLAY BOARDS

Estimated Anouat Product No. Extended Cost
Ttem Mo, niity ltem Description List Price Percentage Discount i Brand
INTERACTEVE FLAT PANEL DISPLAY -
17 INTERACTIVE TOUCH BOARD #1 s % |s | il
| I APEAGS-NA-]
657 Promethean ActivPanel 9 657 280079 435.19% 153520 Promeheay | (5°€ Quot forPan § 52112000
Number/List
a __|600 % |§ | Breakdown) _
i i 20" No Bid NoBid o, |g No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid
— b T -1 AFEATENAT
75" Promethean ActivPanel 9 757 § 427079 | 52820, 201495 Promethesn | (o5 Quo for Part $ 120897000
NomberList
le ___ |60 ] S | 0 I | Brealdownl ]
4 00 50| No Bid| NoBidg, |g No Bid No Bid No Bid No Hid|
i I o [ — | | == APRABGNAT |
( :
55" Promethemn ActivPanel 9 867 § 6,180.79 54,339 282295 Promethean | o¢ Qvote for Pt $ 1,69,770.00
Number/List
3 BM) - L %o |$ - Breakdown)
Included with board | Included with board Included with board Promethean Included with board tncludedstith
i 10040 wall mount 3 = % 15 | = board
, 1000 carvstand| $ 419.00 | 1563% a0, g | 353.50 Promethean APFSM-TR | 8 35350000
Bidder to indicats percentage (%) off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above* 10 % {Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the camlog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

**Discounted unit cost should include Section [LC 24. Reguired Senvices

CATEGORY 9: AUDIO VIDEOQO MEDIA ACCESSORIES

= 4 } \Percentage Discount | Discounted Price |Brand | ProductNo. | Extended Cost
il! 2000 _ ATSC TV Converter Switch No Bid | No Bid [ 3 No Bid . No Bid | | No Bid
|19 2000 4x2 HDMI Matrix Switch No Bid ' No Bid % s No Bid No Bid No Bid
s e I Portable Mobike PA Sysiom | NoBia | NeBd . s No Bid [ wosia NoBid |
21 1500 UHF Cardioid Dy namic Wireless Microphone Sy stem No Bid | No Bid w s | No Bid | No Bid No Bid
22 100 FM Plus-Large-srea Dual FM and Wi-F i base transmitier No Bid No Bid 5 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 S N FM Receiver with seek-bution channel selection o Bud __1 No Bid % |8 No Bid No Bid No Bid . |
24 500 = Folding Headphones | N_o Bid No Bid % IS No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 100  Lare waleresisi Cay Cise | Nemid No Bid % s Ne Bid No Bid No Bid
26 - 20 Neckloop NoBid | No Bid % s No Bid B No Bid NoBi |
27 1500 Mohike Storage Can | No Bid | Ne Bid o s No Bid No Bid | o Bid

Bidder to indicate percentage (%a) off catalog for other
Note ¥z hardware and sofitware ot listed above® % (Percentage discount)

*Please include & copy of the catalog with your bid. This will nos be mcluded i the Basts of Awand

**Discounted unit cost should include Section ILC 24, Required Services

Sconn 111 P
Rate Schediile IFB 2600002368



Section 111
Rate Schedule Section

CATEGORY 10A: INTEGRATION SERVICES WITH WAREHOUSING AND DELIVERY FOR HYBRID COMPONENTS (HUB, CAMERA BAR, EARSPEAKERS, ETC.)
Estimated Annual |
uantity

BIDDER MUST PROVIDE PRICING ON A MINIMUM OF ONE INTEGRATION SERVICES CATEGORY (10A OR 10B) AND MAY PROVIDE PRICING ON BOTH

Cost Per Unit

Item Description Cost
129A 10 SECTION 1- INTEGRATION SERVICES (per una charpe) &5 *Iu
198 2000 SECTION [- INTEGRATION SERVICES (per hour charge)| $47.50
29C 1500 TRAINING SERVICES (per hour) ineluded |
[ *Please include a copy of the catalog with vour bid. This will not be mcluded in the Basis of Award
Sezwon [T 6
Roate Schedake

1FB 200000068




Section IT1
Rate Schedule Section

Bidder “ame: Arev Jones Fducational Solutions

CATEGORY |: BOCUMENT CAMERA

Estimated Annuzsl

Quantity seripiti (List_Price __\Percentage Discount Discounted Price  |Brand o _Product No.
1 99 e Camers 11 LOGTTLCHRLUSDslogieeh g 299.00 13.90° % % 25743 Logheeh 960-081667 § 2548557
onten! camera dase m— 1 1
2 300 1.1.:\ ument Camera #2: LOGITECH - LAUSD - Logitech 5 199,00 13.90% T$ 25743 Logitech 960001568 | 5 77.229.00
{Content camer - clamp . 1 iy 1
Note 1: Bidder to indicate percentage (° o) off catalog fot other 5o {Percentage discount}
*Please nchude a copy of the camlog with your bid. 1his wiil nol be included m the Basis of Award
**Discounted unit cost should include Section [1 € 24. Reguired Services

CATEGORY 2: COLLABORATION DEVICE

Estimated Annual |

liem No. Ouantity Jtem Description Discounted Price Product No. Extended Cost

s T T TP TR pievinT T OEeT T =plenfec o
199 2 with Catse kit | 3 1 . s Loguech 239-001950 g B5.21E.28
T - . —
|09 Obstional 3 eat wal with of-site repairveplicement |s 999.00 031%,, |5 | 696.16 Logitech | 994.000148 3 68.919.85 |

Bidder w indicate percentage (° o) off caialog for other |
Note 1@ hardware and softw are not listed above* 5% (Percentage disconnf)

*Please mnclude a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included iz the Basis of Award

* *Discounted unit cod should mehude Secon 11C 24, Required Services

£ |
TItem No. Quantity i |List Price EPcmnuge Driscount Discounted Price  |Brand Product No. Extended Cost
opabprarion Camera Bar: LOGITECH slogiiech Rally Barg.g 3995,00 1384 | 3,445 48 Lopitech 960001308 § 34100252
4n kid Graphite | " 15
= —4= 1 E—— 4 —_—
" L31% -1 84 |
b 90 [l 3-year service pian s 9599.00 | 031%, | 696.15 Logitech $94-000144 | § £8,919.84
Bidder (o indicate percentage (°v) off catalog for other |
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above* 5% (Percentage disconnt)
*Plense include a copy of the catalog with vour bid. This will not be included in the Dasis of Award
*TLiscounted umit ¢ost should mnclude Secnon ILL . /4. Kequued Sern ices

Product No. Extended Cost

\ |Estimated Anonual
Tiem .. Quantity Item Description n

List Price |Percentage Discount Discounted Price  Brand

S B 1000 l!'lu:ulllr Duial Monitor Dockmg Station Hub 5 139.99 48.38% 5 72.76 Plugable | UD-3%00H g 72,760.00
|Sh luum Optional 2nd year manufacturer warranty Included with Dock | Included with Dock % |§ | included with Dock Plugable Included with Dock Included with Dock

Bidder to indicate percentage (o) off catalop for other
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above* 5% (Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with vour bid. This will not be mcluded m the Basis of Award
L **Lhiscounted unit cost shoukd mnelude 1LC 24, Ke ces

liem No, ltem Description = |List Price Percentage Discount | Discounted Price | Brand i Prodoct No. | Extended Cost
|

el 1. - | - T
le 100,000 3 St Stereo Headsets with Boom Mic H 20,99 5519080 o g 9.42 Think W rite | .T.W 100 5 942,000.00
Bidder 1o mdicate percentage (%) off catalog for other
Note 1= hardwarg and software not listed above* A% {Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be inchuded in the Basis of Award
** Discounted unit cost should inehide Section [1C_ 24, Required Services

Estimated Annual |
o __|Quantity Ttem Deseription = |?List Price Percentage Discount Discounted Price | Brand 1 Product No. Extended Cost
No Bid No Bid | MNoBd | NoBi No Bid No Bid

Ta - 1900 |Projectur #1 ~ | = | 5

Optional Peerless cedling mount suspension plate and No Bid “o Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
b SO0 extension column and or other District-approved ma d _ ]
8 ) 300 |Projector #2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid

__|s00 | S SEN—
9, 800 Projecior 43 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid . No Bid i No Bid | | No Bid )
W 199 Projector #4 | No Bid | No Bid | Ne Bid i l Ne Bid Mo Bid No Bid
= | 1 -+
IE 0 No Bid No Bid | Ne Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
i e

Rase Sohedule JFB 2000007 368



Section [11

CATEGORY 7: INTERACTIVE COMPATIBLE DRY ERASER BOARDS AND PROJECTION SCREENS

Rate Schedule Section
No Bid No Bid o Rid No B No Bid No Bid
1 10 Projector #6
Bidder to indicate percentage (%« off catalog for other
Note 1= hardware and sofiware not listed above* 9 {Percentape discount)

*Please mclude a copy of the catalng with your bid. ¥his will iol be meluded in the Basis ot Award

*+Driscounled und cost should include Section [LC. 24. Reguired Services

Estimated Annual | 1

liem No. Cuantity ltem Description \List Price  |Percentage Discount Discounted Price | Hrand Product No. “xtended Cost
n
N 1000 I..T“H“ TIVE COMPATIBELE DRY ERASER BOARD No Bid No Bid e e No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
i4 500 |PROJECTION SCREEN #1 No Bid . No Bid 5 ;S No Bid | No Bid B No Bid No Bid
L 4 — i 1
| No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 SO0 PROJIECTION SCREEN #2 | % 15 | o
! | 5 No Bid [ No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
[16 200 |PROJEC TI0N SCREEN #3 ] | %0 |8 |
Hudder 1o mdicate percentage (%) off catalog for other
Note 1: hardwarg and software not listed above* g (Percentage discount)

| THiedse meude 4 Copy of the calaiog W in Your bia. [ is Wi not be moluged in e Basis of A ard
| ** Discounted unit cost should nchude Secton 1LC 24 Required Services -

Ttem Nou

CATEGORY 8: INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL TOUCH DISPLAY BOARDS

Estimated Annual
antity

Extended Cost

[INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL DISPLAY -

nr___ 1 INTERACTIVE TOUCH BOARD #1 s 5% |5 | ol
ATH-BOS-NA-]
| 65" Promethean ActivPanel @ Premim 65°| § 3,220.79 41.81% 1.777.60 Promethean (See Quote f".r Fid $ 1,066,560.00
NumberList
a (L) * 15 | Breakdown)
b lsop 20 No Rid NoBid. ¢ No Bid No Bid | wopid | No B
I T = | APEAT-N A
75" Promethean ActrvPanel 9 Premium 757 § ,690.79 51340 229260  Promethean | (55¢ Quote for Pun $  1,369,36000
| ) ) | NumberList
£ |600 ! | E— LI ] ——ee e | Breakdownl
d léoo o No Bid NoBida, g No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid
W, [ ) - APIBEG-NA-I
|
| 85" Promethean ActivPanel & Premium 867 £,600.79 53.18% 309060 Promethesn | (50 Quole for Fan $  1.854,360.00
| | Number/List
| % % Breakdown |
== | ;
| ) wall mouy| eluded with board [included with board ]‘ Included withboard  Promethean | Inciuded with board '“°I"bf:‘r’d“ N
] -
—_—— 419.00 1563% 0, |5 353.50 Promethean AP-FSM-TR S 353,500.00
Bidder to mdicate percentage (%4} off catalog for ofher
Noie 1: hardware and software not Fsied ahove® 10 % {Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

** Discounted unit cost should nclude Secton 11L.C 24 Required Senvices

Senton 111

Estimated Annual
liem No. Quantity Percentage Discount Discounted Price E q Extended Cost
i8 2000 | ATSC TV Comverter Switch ~ NoBid | No Bid % s Mo Bid | NoBid 1 No Bid
19 2000 ' 4x2 HDMI Matrix Switch NoBid No Bid % 1§ No Bid - No Bid No Bid
21 1500 Portable Mobile PA System No Bid o Bid_ w s NoBid ] No Bid | No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid

21 1500 Dynamic Wireless Microphone Sy stem ! g wgs | TP . A .
22 100 réa Dual FM and Wi-Fi base iransmitier o Bid hiolid % s No B No Bid Mo Bid
23 |S00 'EM Receiver with seck-bution channel selection No Bid Mo Bid % |$ Ne Bid Mo Bid __NoBid _ |
24 500 Folding Headphones No Bid No Bid % _I$ | No Bid | No Bid No Bid
25 100 Large water-resistant Carry Case No Bid Ne Bid 5 s No Bid Ne Bid No 8id
46 200 Neckloop No Bid o Bid s fs | No Bid No Bid No Bid |
27 £500 Maobile Storage Cart J No Bid No Bid . |8 I No Bid NoBd | No Bid

Bidder 1o indicale percentage (%) off catalog for ather

Note 1: hardwarc and sofiware not listed above* 8% {Percentage discount}

*Please include a copy ofthe camalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

L **Discounted unit cost should inclede Section L1LC 24 Kequired Services
B8

IFE 2000002358




Secion I
Rate Schedule Section

BIDDER MUST PROVIDE PRICING ON A MINIMUM OF ONE INTEGRATION SERVICES CATEGORY (104 OR 10B) AND MAY PROVIDE PRICING ON BOTH
CATEGORY 10A: INTEGRATION SERVICES WITH WAREHOUSING AND DELIVERY FOR HYBRID COMPONENTS (1

B, CAMERA BAR. EARSPEAKERS. ETC.)
Estimated Annual |
. Item Description
28 | —_[SECTION 1- INTEGRATION SERVICES

[Cost Per Unit
| $53.75]

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

CATEGORY 10B: INTEGRATION SERVICES FOR NON-HY BRID COMPONENTS (INCLUDING PROJECTORS, DOCUMENT CAMERAS, INTERACTIVE TOUCH FLAT PANEL DISPLAYS, ETC.)

Estimated Annual

Cost
29A TUHH) SECTION 1- INTEGRATION SI RVICES (per unit charge) 559.50]
98 2(HH) SECTION |- INTEGRATION SERVICES (per hour charge) 34750/
29C 1500 TRAINING SERVICES (per hour) Inchided

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

Secnom 1] e
Hae Schedule

IFB 2000002368



Section 1N
Raie Schedule Section

CATEGORY 1: DOCUMENT CAMERA

[Estimated Annual

Note 1: Bidder 10 indicate percentage (®o) off catalog for ofhier

*Pease include a copy of the catalog with vour bid. 1his will not be ncluded m the Basis of Award
*Discounted unit cast should mclude Section 11.C. 24, Required Services

uan __ltem Description |]_'5| Price |Percentage Discount
1 oo Document Camera #1: LOGITECH : LAUSD - Logite $ 299.00 11.90% %o
1 \Content camera hase 1 1
2 300 Document Camera #2° LOGITECH - LAUSD - Logitex! ls 29900 13,005 %
|Content camer - clamp N J_ =

Bidder Name: Arev Jones Educational Solufions

Discounted Price |Brand Product No. Estended Cost |

| 25743 Logitech S60-001667 $ 2548557
- — -

| 25743 Logitech 960-001668 $ 77,229.00

5%a (Percentage discount) !

CATEGORY 2: COLLABORATION DEVICE

|

| Hign List Price Percentage Discount Discounted Price  |Brand nded Cost

[ TRIPV T COEIECTT Tapy C OmoT SCrcci- © Crswo | T | T AT P - BT

3a lgo : s 999.00 153.84%0, |g 860.72 Logitech 939001950 3 85,211.28

k | e WL SN - — + -
\3h [ Optional 3-vear warmanty with on-site repairreplacement |$ SO0 3031%., s | 696.16 Logitech 994000148 $ (68919.84 |

Bidder to indicate percentage (“o} off catalog for other
hardware and software not listed above*

*Plezse include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included i the Basts of Award
**Discounied unit cost should nclude Section ILC. 24, Keguired Senvices

5% (Percentage discount)

CATHGORY 3: COLLABORATION CAMERA BAR
Estimated Annual
Lem N, Cuantity Ttem Description List_Price ____\Percentage Discount Discounted Price  |Brand Product No. Extended Cost
Ghitaborationr Camera Bar: TOGITECH gLogitech Rally Bty 3.999.00 13,842 3.445.48 Logiterh 060-001308 § 0 341,10252
4a 99 Giraphite - | - % ~ | :
b % |O3pional 3 r service plan $ 095 00 30.31% v s 696.16 Logitech | 993-000148 $ 68.919.84

Bidder to indicate percentage (%o) off catalog for other

Note 1: hardware and software not listed above®

*Please include a capy ol the catalog with your brd. T'hus will nol be mcluded i the Basis of Award
** Lhscounted unit cost should include Sechion ILL - 249, Keqmred »ervices

5% (Percentage discount)

Estimated & nnual |
Cruantity Ttem Description [ List Price Percentage Discount Discounted Price  Brand Product No. Extended Cost
1
JLILLCH Plugable Dual Monitor Docking Staton Hub § 13999 | 48.38% % [ .76 Flugable LD-3900H $ 72,760.00
lsh 100 |Oyptional 2nd vear manufscturer warranty i Included with Dock | Inchided with Dock % [$ | Included with Dock Plugable Included with Dock Inchided with Dock
Ridder o indicate percentage (*o) ofT catalog for other
| Note 13 hardware and software not listed above*

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be ncluded in the Basis of Award
**scounted unit cost should melude Sechon 11.C

24 Heguired Senvices

5% (Percenmge discount)

CATEGORY 5: STUDENT HEADSETS

Estimated Annual
ltem No wantity ~ |ltem Description List_Price Percentage Discount | Discounted Price  |Brand Product No. Extended Cost
bl 0, | i " |
| 100,000 3.Smm Stereo Headsets with Boom Mic| i $510%, s | 4 L gy ol E2Oey
[ o |
Bidder to indicate percentage (2s) off catalog for other
Nole 1= hardware and sofiware sot listed above® 5% (Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catatog with yvour bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
**Discounted unit cost should inciude Section 11.C. 24. Kequired Services

Estimated Annual |
[ltem No._ = _[ltem Description = List Price Percentage Discount Diseounted Price |Brand Product No. Extended Cost
i No Bid No Bid No Bi i ‘o Bi
Ta 900 Projector #1 Ji MNelBid | o Bi o o Bid No Bid No Bid
Optional Peerless ceiling ension plate i No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid |
Th WY extension column and or other Distrct-approved m o
B 800 Projector £2 I No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
I - S
Ll ';ou Projector #3 1 No Bid Lio Bl No Bid B No Bid . No Bid No Bid
l10 199 Prajector #4 No Bid | NoBi No Bid No Bid [ No Bid No Bid
| T
. No Bid Ne Bid No Bud No Bid [ No Bid No Bid
1 |10 Projecton # | o B d
Seation 1 6%
Rese Scincirle

ITB 2000002368



Section [T
Rate Schedule Section

Nn Bid No Dad ’ l No Bid No Bid o Bid | \ Mo Bid

12 10 Projector #6
Bidder to indicate percentage (°o) afl catalog for other
Note 1 hardware and software not listed above* s (Perventage discount)

| T Pigase nglude a copy of the catalog with your bid. Lhis will not be included m the Basis ot Awand
** Discounted unit cost should include Section 11 C. 24. Required Services

CATEGORY 7: INTERACTIVE COMPATIBLE DRY ERASER BOARDS AND PROVECTION SCREENS

T PICASE NCINGE 8 COPY O M CALAINE WIN 3 OUr 0. | IS W 1 NOT 08 NCIUAED N Me Basis oT Awand

Estimated Aanual
Item Neo. uantity ltem Deseription =l i List Price Percentage Discount = Produoct No. Extended Cost

| ’ i 7 T T T
[y 1000 !:1ERACT]\[COMPATIB[F DRY ERASER BOARD No Bid Ne Bid i No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 500 PROJECTION SCREEN #1 No Bid No Bid w |s | Mo Bid Ne Bid No Bud No Bid

! | 1 1 |
! | ™o Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid
15 |800 |PROJECTION SCREEN 82 - | % s | A

No Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
16 [200 PROIECTION SCREEN #3 § | | % |8 | _ R
Bidder 10 indicate percentage (%o} off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above® % (Percentage discount)

** Discounted unit cc

should mclude Secion 11LC_ 24 Required Senvices -

CATEGORY 8: INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL TOUCH DISPLAY BOARDS

| Estimated Annual [ Product No, Extended Cost
liem No. Quantity it \List_Price Percentage Discount Discounted Price | Brand {
INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL DISPLAY - |
17 INTERACTIVE TOUCH BOARD &1 = 5 % |8 | 0,
+ BETRIDK-H
$5" LG ELECRONICS U'SA : 6515 § 1,641.49 61350 140753 LG e $ 84451800
| Number/List
I (|, ! S ) _ % [§ | Breakdown)
. leo Es No Hid| NoBid o, | No Bid No Bid NoBid Ko Bid
I _ — TSTRIDK B
75" LG ELECRONICS 1/SA : 75175| § 447449 | 61440, 172555 16 e $ 103533000
| . uenber/L st
I3 JLL 1 e | i s 1S | Hreakdown
: t ]
la o e No Bid NoBids, |g o Bid o Bid No Bid No Hid
) [ : 1 36TRIDK-B
|\ 85" LG ELECRONICS USA : S61PS| § 6,077.49 | 62.16% 229994 LG [Se:fﬁz‘;’:rﬁ: - $ 137996400
e JLEL0 o Breakdown)
I ;
: - i wall mount] ® 63.00 | w0z, s | 3766 LG WM-L0DOS § 3700000
le 1000 carstand| 490,00 | P 273 LG STO0F | s 27304000
Bidder to indicate percentage (%) off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and sofiware not listed above* 10 % (Percentage discoust)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

** Discounted unit cost should include Section 11.C. 24, Required Services

Estl d Anpual
1tem No. Quantity ltem Bescription |List_Price Percentage Discount Product No. Extended Cost
| . H . - .
18 2000 | ATSC TV Converter Switch No Bid 1 NoBid i s | NoBid : No Bid
19 2000 4x2 HDMI Matrix Switch_ No Bid | No Bid 5 s No Bid No Bid
20 1500 | Portable Mohile PA System __ Nobid ] No Rid w8 NoBid | No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
21 1500 UHF Cardiowd Dynam ficrophone System | . s - -
2 100 FM Plus-Large-area Dual FM and Wi-Fi hase transmitter Np Bid ] No Bid % [s | No Bid No Bid | MNoBid
22 500 EM Receiver with seek-button channel selection No Bid | No Bid % IS No Bid | NoBid NoBid |
24 300 - Folding Headphones No Bid ‘ No Bid “ I No Bid NoBid | | Nohu
23 100 sater-resistant Carry C; Nobid No Bid s o B No Bid _ NoBid
26 204} Neckloop Ne Bid | *o Bid % s No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 1500 Mobile Stomge Cart No Bud 1 No Bid “ |s No Bid i | No Bid ~ NoBid
Bidder ro indicate percentage {%) off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above® %o (Percentage discount)
*Pleasc include a copy of the catatog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award |
L **Discounted unit cost should include Section IL.C. 24 Reguined Services o
Sechom [[1 (=3

R schadule [F B 2000002368



Section IH
Rate Schedule Section

BIDDER MUST PROVIDE PRICING ON A MINIMUM OF ONE INTEGRATION SERVICES CATEGORY (10A OR 10B) AND MAY PROVIDE PRICING ON BOTH

CATEGORY 10A: INTEGRATION SERVICES WITH WAREHOUSING AND DELIVERY FOR HYBRID COMPONENTS (HUB, CAMERA BAR, EARSPEAKERS, ETC.)

Estimated Annual
Quantity Item Description . Cost Per Unit =
% JEE) SECTION - INTEGRATION SERVICES 553.75

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be meluded in the Basis of Award

CATEGORY 108: INTEGRATION SERVICES FOR NON-HYBRID COMPONENTS (INCLUDING PROJECTORS, DOCUMENT CAMERAS, INTERACTIVE TOUCH FLAT PANEL DISPLAYS. | TC.)
Estimated Annual

5 Cuantity i
294 {1000 ISECTION |- FGRATION SERVICES (per unit charge)

Cost

9B 2000 [SECTION 1= INTEGRATION SERVICES (per hour charge]|

29C 1500 [TRAINING SERVICES (per hour) [Included

|| *Please include a copy of the catalog with yoor bid. This will not be included in the Rasis of Award
{
|

Seamm 1 1
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ORY I DOCUMENT CAMERA

Seetion [T
Rute Schedule Scetion

Note 1:

Bidder to indicate percentage {%») off catalog for other

*Please inchude a copy ol the catalop with your bid. 1 his will not be mcluded m the Basis o Award
**Driscounted unil cost should include Section 11.C. 24. Reguired Servicesy

CATEGORY 2: COLLABORATION DEVICE

Estimated Annual

__|Quantity

Estimated Annual
Quantity (ltem Description List_Price
Document Camera #1: LOGITECH - LAUSD - Lognech
1 99 B | Content camera base $ 299.00 | 13.90% "o
i ora ¥ - Logitec |
B 300 [ocument € ra LOGITECH © LAUSE - Logitech 3 250 08 13906 96
___[Content cam clamp |

Hidder Name: Arey Jones Educational Solutions

Extended Cost

£ 2548557
|

Discounted Price  |Brand Product No.
257.43 Logitech 960-001667
257.43 Logitech 960001668

$ 7722900 |

S i P'ercentage discounty

Note 1:

CATEGORY 3: COLLABORATION CAMERA BAR

ptio L N .
. ger n sl List Price Percentage Discount o Brand Product No. Extended Cost
2 with CaiSe Kit 3 S09.00 1384% 0, |g Boil 72 Logitech 939-001950 1 85,211.28
Cptional 3-vear warmanty wi 3 999.00 3031%., |5 69616 Logitech 994-00014% 5 6891984
Bidder o indicate perces [
hardware and software qot listed above* 3% (Percentage discoual)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with vour bid. This will not be included in the Basis of A ward

*#*Discounted unit cost should include Section 11024, Required Senices

Estimated Annual

Quantity ltem Description _ List Price Percentage Discount

= i..n.JI;:bomllun Camera Bar: LOGITECH = Logitech Rally Har 5 1,999.00 13.84%

|99 \Liraphite . %o |8
99 [Ohptional 3-year service plan $ 9\)9‘00.1 3031%

Note 1:

Bidder to indicate percentage (“o) ofl catalog for other
hardware and software ot histed above*

*Please mclude a copy of the catabog with vour bid. This will not be included in te Basis of Awand
= * Wiscounted unil cost shiould nclede echon 1L 24, Keguired Services

696.

344548

Brand

Logitech 950-001308

ie Logitech 994-000148

Extended Cost
3 341.102.52

3 68.919.84

%o (Percentage discounr)

Estimated Annual

Note 1=

Discounted Price

72

5

Brand Product No.

Extended Cost

76 Plugable UD-3960H

Thern ;.. Quantity ltem Description List Price Percentage Discount
Sa 1000 Plugable Dual Monitor Docking Sttion Huh $ e 4838%
sh L1000 Optional 2nd year manufacturer waranty | Included with Dock | Ickided with Dack 2

§ | Included with Dock

Bidder e indicate percentage (*o) off catalog for other
hardware and software not Bsted above®

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

**scounted umit cost should imclo

CATEGORY 5: STUDENT HEADSETS

Estimated Attaual
[uantity

100,000

Sechon 1.4 24 Heguired Services

Plugable

5% (Percentge discount)

ltem Description

List Price

3 5mm Stereo Headsets with Boom M 2

Nate 1:

Discounted Price |Brand
9.4z

| Included with Dock

] 72.760.00

Included with

1 Dok

Prodoct Ne,

Extended Cost

Think Write TW-100

3 242.000.00

Bidder to indicate percentage (%) off catalog for other
hardware and software not listed above*

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
** Discounied unit cost should include Section [LC 24, Reyuired Services

5% (Perventzge discount}

Estimated Annual |
Item No. Quantity Item Description _jList Price Percentage Discount Discounted Price _Product No. Extended Cost
L No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
l-‘h 200 |Prajector #1 | |
t —
Optional Peerless cetling mount suspension plate and No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lextension cotumn and or other District-approved manu facturer | | i) Al |
s 800 |Projector #2 - | No Bicd | b_ix_s Bid ND_BId No Bid No Bid No Bid
bu — 500 |Projetor #3 i} No Bid No B_id_ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
!m ‘TI'J'J |Projector #4 ] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
T | T
i 0 A No Bid No Bid No Bi | o Bid o Bid NoBid
L 1 LSS MR ES— N L EEI; W ——
Sewon 111 &%
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Section |11

Rate Schedube Section
T
No Rid o Bid No Rid No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
12 10 Projector #6
Bidder o indicate percentage (26} off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and sofiware not listed above* %4 {Percentage discount)
{ *Please nclude a copy of the catalog with your bud. §his will ot be meluded in the Basis of Award
#* Discounted wiit cost should include Section [1.C. 24. Required Servives

CATEGORY 7: INTERACTIVE COMPATIBLE DRY ERASER BOARDS AND PROJECTION SCREENS

| Estimated Annual | I
lem No. (Juantity (Ttem Deseription List Price Percentage Discount Discounted Price  |Brand | Product No. “atended Cost
| . I:NTERACT]\-F COMPATIBLE DRY ERASER BOARD o Bid N Bid . No Bid No Rid No Bid No Bid
1 1000 Gl L s |$ | !
| . . . -
|14 1800 PROJECTION SCREEN #1 No Bid No B o, s ] No Bid No Bid No Bid Iﬁoﬂi N
1
No Bid ~No Bid l No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid I
|15 I PREVECTION SCREEN #2 . 1 i % |5 | |
NoBid No Bid [ No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid
16 200 _____PROJECTION SCREEN #2 | __ |
Bidder @ indicate percentage (%) ofY catnlog for other
Note 13 hardware and software: nan listed above*® ¢ {Percentage drscoun) |
"IEASE MNCIROE 4 COPY O] e CA@IDE Wi YOUT DI, LNIS WL N0T DE citded i the Basis o1 Awang
L ** Discounted unit cost should include Section 11.C 24, Required Senvices

CATEGORY 8: INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL TOUCH DISPLAY BOARDS

Estimated Annual | Product No. Estended Cost
Ttem No. Quantity Item Description |List Price Percentage Discount Discounted Price
1 T
INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL DISPLAY -
17 UNTERACTIVE TOUCH BOARD #1 5 T ] 1 i
] | P30
65" ViewSonic 65 imches ViewBoard 4K Ulma HD § 4.066.00 72.39% ,122.73 ViewSonic (See Quote for 'an % 673.638.00
la i) | [ Number Breakdown)
e S I . il
b 600 M N Hud NoBid. | No Hud No Bid | No Bid Nu Bid
] - S— = : |
757 View Sonic Advanced 73 inch Ulitra HD ViewBoard § 6.116.00 76.27% 1451 4 ViewSonie | (Ser §  870,624.00
e L] Interactive Flat Pangl % IS Number Breakdow i) 1
la 00 w0e] No Bid| NoBil,, s | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
| IFPE650
83" View Sonic 8éinches V icw Hoard 4k Ul HD $ 2,016.00 T8.00% 1,983 83 ViewSonic | (See Quote for Pan $  1.190.298.00
e | 6N} Interactive Flat Panel] % |8 i'ﬁuml\cr Hreakdown)
L — 1 Il i = e e
1000 wall mownt, 3 109,00 32000, |y 5101 ViewSonic WMK-047-2 5 5101000 |
§ 1000 _cartistand] 799.00 6555% e, |5 | 272.06 ViewSonic | VB-STND-001 | § 272.060.00
Bidder to indicate percentage (%) ofF catalog for ather
Note 1= hardvware and software not listed above® 10 % (Percentage discount)

*Please melude a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be mcluded in the Basis of Award

** Discounted unit cost should include Section 11.C. 24, Reguired Senvices

CATEGORY %: AUDID VIDEO MEDIA ACCESSORIES

Estimated Annual
Item No. Quantity List Price Percentage Discount Discounted Price | Rrand Product No. Extended Cosf
18 2000 ATSC TV Converter Switch No Bid faiBid % I Holbid - D Bid | ‘__ No Bid
19 62-“9" B 4x2 HDMI Matrix Switch No Bid | No Bid o, :'! No Hid | Nu_[-hd _Nu ?hl.
0 1500 _ 0 Portable Mobile PA Sistem No Bid No Bid % s No Bid JL__NaBidf LHoEid
21 1500 UHE Cardiond Dynamic Wireless Microphone System No B Mo B s ls BoBid | [k Mo Bid
1 LT FM Plus-Lar yual FM and Wi-Fi base tranemitier NoBid __ NoBid % |8 No Bid No Bid o Bid
3 500 | FM Recever with seek-button channel selection | NoBid 1 No Bid % |8 No Bid No Bid NoBid |
2 s00 Folding Headphones No Bid [ No Bid W s No Bid No Bid NoBid |
35 100 _ Lamewatenmsistant Cary Case No Bid | nomié . s No Bid Nao Bid | No Bid
26 oo Neckioop [ womd | Nosi o & No Bid - NoBid | No Bid
l27 1500 Mobile Stomee Cart No Bid No Bid o, g No Bid | NaBid I No Bid
Bidder 10 indicate pencentage (%0} oft catalog for other
| Note 1: hardware and softwate not listed above* %o (Percentage discount)
*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included i the Basis of Award
|
[ ** Discounted unit cost should include Section 1LC. 24, Required Senvices =
Section 1§] IS
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Seetion ITT
Rate Schedule Section

liem No.

CATEGORY 10A: INTEGRATION SERVICES WITH WAREHOUSING AND DELIVERY FOR HYBRID COMPONENTS (HUR, CAMERA BAR, EARSPEAKERS, ETC.)

| Estimated Annual

BIDDER MUST PROVIDE PRICING ON A MINIMUM OF ONE INTEGRATION SERVICES CATEGORY (10A OR 10B) AND MAY PROVIDE PRICING ON BOTH

lItem Description Cost Per Unit

28

—Quantiry
kel

ISECTION 1- INTEGRATION SERVICES 853

CATEGORY 108: INTEGRATION SERVICES FOR NON-HY BRID COMPONENTS (INCLUDING PROJECTORS, DOCUMENT CAMERAS, INTERACTIVE TOUCH FLAT PANEL DISPLAYS, ETC.)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

Estimated Annual
liem Nao. Quantity Ttem Description Cosi
1294 1000 [SECTION 1- INTEGRATION SERVICES (per unil charge} 53050
1298 (2000 SELCTION 1= INTEGRA TION SERVICES (per hour charge)| $47.50
29C 1500 [TRAINING SERVICES (per hour) [Inchuded

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your hid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

Scaon 111
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